From: Hyde, Kevin E. [KHyde@foley.com]

Sent: 9/19/2019 6:10:19 PM

To: Kirwan, Michael B. [MKirwan@foley.com]

cC: Lever Jr, Chauncey W. [CLever@foley.com]; Magee, Emily F. [EMagee@foley.com]
Subject: Re: JEA

Thanks. | will make these changes.
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 19, 2019, at 5:30 PM, Kirwan, Michael B. <MKirwan@foley.com> wrote:

Kevin,

Chatincey and | have discussed the JEA language and think the attached edits should be made. 15¢2-12 will be triggered
if the full 100,000 of units are issued so as long as they issue less then ok on that front.

Michael

Michas! B. Kirwan

Foley & Lardner LLP

One Independent Drive | Suite 1300
Jacksornwille, FL 32202-5017
P904.633.8913
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From: jax_1303bc@{oleyv.com <jax_ 1303be@ foley.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 19, 2019 5:27 PM

To: Kirwan, Michael B. <MKirwan@foley.com>

Subject: Attached Image
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